



Rhode Island Airport Corporation

IFB 27334- Uniforms - Operations & Maintenance

Bid Abstract

November 9, 2017 @ 2PM

Item No.	Description	Express Press	International Promotional Ideas (IPI)	S&H Uniform Corp	Size
1	Short Sleeve Shirt	\$ 15.11	\$ 19.25	\$ 20.00	S-XL
		\$ 17.11		\$ 22.00	XXL
		\$ 18.11		\$ 22.00	3XL
		\$ 19.11		\$ 24.00	4XL
		\$ 20.11		\$ 24.00	5XL
		\$ 21.11		\$ 26.00	6XL
2	Short Sleeve Shirt - womens	\$ 15.11	\$ 19.25	\$ 20.00	S-XL
		\$ 17.11		\$ 22.00	XXL
		\$ 18.11		\$ 22.00	3XL
		\$ 19.11		\$ 24.00	4XL
		\$ 20.11		\$ 24.00	5XL
		\$ 21.11		\$ 26.00	6XL
3	Long Sleeve Shirt	\$ 15.11	\$ 20.25	\$ 20.00	S-XL
		\$ 17.11		\$ 22.00	XXL
		\$ 18.11		\$ 22.00	3XL
		\$ 19.11		\$ 24.00	4XL
		\$ 20.11		\$ 24.00	5XL
		\$ 21.11		\$ 26.00	6XL
4	Long Sleeve Shirt - womens	\$ 15.11	\$ 20.25	\$ 20.00	S-XL
		\$ 17.11		\$ 22.00	XXL
		\$ 18.11		\$ 22.00	3XL
		\$ 19.11		\$ 24.00	4XL
		\$ 20.11		\$ 24.00	5XL
		\$ 21.11		\$ 26.00	6XL
5	Polo Shirt	\$ 15.11	\$ 19.25	\$ 20.00	S-4XL
6	Polo Shirt - womens	\$ 15.11	\$ 19.25	\$ 20.00	S-4XL
7	Short Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 4.13	\$ 5.95	\$ 7.50	S-XL
		\$ 6.13		\$ 8.50	XXL
		\$ 7.13		\$ 8.50	3XL
		\$ 8.13		\$ 11.50	4XL
8	Spring Jacket	No Bid	\$ 42.50	\$ 57.00	S-4XL
9	Winter Jacket	No Bid	\$ 99.50	\$ 98.00	S-5XL
10	Pants	No Bid	\$ 29.75	\$ 38.00	28-54
11	Pants - womens	No Bid	\$ 29.75	\$ 44.00	2-20
12	Coveralls	No Bid	\$ 31.50	\$ 38.50	34-60
13	Insulated Coveralls	No Bid	\$ 66.50	\$ 74.50	S-2XL
				\$ 78.50	3XL-5XL
14	Waterproof Gloves	No Bid	\$ 16.95	\$ 8.60	S-2XL
15	Rain Jacket	No Bid	\$ 46.75	\$ 58.50	S-5XL
16	Rain Pant	No Bid	\$ 14.50	\$ 34.50	S-5XL
17	Cap	No Award			