



Rhode Island Airport Corporation

Bid Abstract

IFB NO. 27801RR ARFF Ancillary Equipment

3-Sep-19

| BIDDER NAME: | | | | Fire Tech and Safety of New England, Inc. | | Firematic Supply, Inc. | | Shipman's Fire Equipment Co., Inc. | |
|--------------------|---------------|--|----------|---|----------------|------------------------|----------------|------------------------------------|----------------|
| Item # | Vehicle Class | Description | Quantity | Price per Unit | Extended Price | Price per Unit | Extended Price | Price per Unit | Extended Price |
| A.3 | IV | Halligan Bar - 36" | 2 | \$ 240.00 | \$480.00 | \$ 208.00 | \$416.00 | \$ 211.50 | \$423.00 |
| A.4 | IV | Axe - flat head, fiberglass handle, 36" with mounting bracket (for married set w/halligan tool) | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 280.00 | \$560.00 | \$ 235.00 | \$470.00 |
| A.5 | IV | 36" crowbar | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 50.00 | \$100.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| A.6 | IV | Cutter, cable, 24" | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 69.00 | \$138.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$100.00 |
| A.7 | IV | Hacksaw - heavy duty, 12" with pistol grip and six (6) assorted blades | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 65.00 | \$130.00 |
| A.9 | IV | Hammer - 16oz, non-sparking | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 125.00 | \$250.00 |
| A.10 | IV | Hammer - Sledge, 8lb with fiberglass handle | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 45.00 | \$90.00 |
| A.11 | IV | Knife - rescue, v-blade (harness cutting too) | 4 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 95.00 | \$380.00 |
| A.20 | IV | Blanket, fire resistant with storage pouch | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 95.00 | \$190.00 |
| A.21 | IV | Wheel chocks - one set(2 chocks) with mounting brackets | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 70.00 | \$140.00 | \$ 339.00 | \$678.00 |
| A.23 | IV | Portable rechargeable, weatherproof, intrinsically safe hand-held lanterns having a minimum 25,000 beam candle power rating with straps. Chargers to be mounted in cab wired into vehicle electrical system for charging | 4 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 93.00 | \$372.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| A.24 | IV | Pike pole, 8ft with fiberglass handle and mounting hardware | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 275.00 | \$550.00 |
| A.25 | IV | Pike pole, 4ft "D" handle and mounting hardware | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 199.00 | \$398.00 |
| A.26 | IV | Rescue kit, pneumatic air hammer, chisel standard duty type, complete with spare air cylinder, carrying case and various tips | 2 | \$ 2,045.00 | \$4,090.00 | \$ 933.00 | \$1,866.00 | \$ 10,325.00 | \$20,650.00 |
| A.27 | IV | Rescue saw, 16" (index C) complete with one (1) box of spare blades (composite masonry blades) for metal. Including mounting hardware | 2 | \$ 2,595.00 | \$5,190.00 | \$ 1,954.00 | \$3,908.00 | \$ 2,145.00 | \$4,290.00 |
| A.28 | IV | Rope, 100 ft - 5/8 in Dia. | 4 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 180.00 | \$720.00 |
| A.29 | IV | Fire extinguishers having a minimum 20 B/C UL rating of either dry chemical or clean steaming agent with mounting brackets | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 167.00 | \$334.00 | \$ 49.99 | \$99.98 |
| A.30 | IV | Fire extinguishers Class D powder (30 lb with mounting bracket) | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 514.00 | \$1,028.00 | \$ 591.00 | \$1,182.00 |
| A.32 | IV | Powered firefighting hydraulic rescue tool with cutters, spreaders, ram and power unit, hoses and mounting hardware (heavy duty battery operated) | 2 | \$ 31,576.00 | \$63,152.00 | \$ 33,413.00 | \$66,826.00 | \$ 14,945.00 | \$29,890.00 |
| A.33 | IV | Heavy Duty canvas hydrant bag with straps | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 85.00 | \$170.00 |
| A.34 | IV | Gate valve 2 1/1" | 4 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 239.00 | \$956.00 | \$ 275.00 | \$1,100.00 |
| A.35 | IV | Female gated reducing wye. 2 1/2" female x (2) 1 1/2" male | 2 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 239.00 | \$478.00 | \$ 350.00 | \$700.00 |
| A.36 | IV | Adjustable hydrant wrench capable of accommodating up to a 1.75" (4.4 cm) pentagon nut and up to a 1.25" (3.2 cm) square nut | 2 | \$ 80.00 | \$160.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$66.00 | \$ 31.00 | \$62.00 |
| A.37 | IV | 2-1/2" spanner wrenches w/bracket | 4 | \$ 108.00 | \$432.00 | \$ 74.00 | \$296.00 | \$ 93.00 | \$372.00 |
| A.38 | IV | 1" spanner wrenches w/bracket | 4 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 74.00 | \$296.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| A.39 | IV | LDH spanner wrenches w/bracket | 4 | \$ 120.00 | \$480.00 | \$ 76.00 | \$304.00 | \$ 87.00 | \$348.00 |
| A.40 | IV | Reducer, non-swivel - 2 1/2" to 1 1/2" | 4 | \$ 27.00 | \$108.00 | \$ 19.00 | \$76.00 | \$ 27.00 | \$108.00 |
| A.41 | IV | Double female couplings - 1 1/2" | 2 | \$ 25.00 | \$50.00 | \$ 23.00 | \$46.00 | \$ 24.00 | \$48.00 |
| A.42 | IV | Double female couplings - 2 1/2" | 2 | \$ 35.00 | \$70.00 | \$ 37.00 | \$74.00 | \$ 32.00 | \$64.00 |
| A.43 | IV | Double male couplings 1 1/2" | 2 | \$ 20.00 | \$40.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$24.00 | \$ 19.00 | \$38.00 |
| A.44 | IV | Double male couplings 2 1/2" | 2 | \$ 25.00 | \$50.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$34.00 | \$ 18.00 | \$36.00 |
| A.45 | IV | 1 3/4" x 50 ft rubber/synthetic, with 1 1/2" NST couplings | 12 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 132.00 | \$1,584.00 | \$ 198.00 | \$2,376.00 |
| A.46 | IV | 1 1/12" hand line nozzle, with pistol grip and ball | 4 | \$ 550.00 | \$2,200.00 | \$ 568.00 | \$2,272.00 | \$ 875.00 | \$3,500.00 |
| A.47 | IV | Foam tank drum wrench tool (1) per station | 2 | \$ 25.00 | \$50.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$24.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| A.48 | IV | 5 gal pail wrench (1) per station | 2 | \$ 25.00 | \$50.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$24.00 | \$ 15.00 | \$30.00 |
| A.49 | IV | Positive pressure, variable speed, 18" gasoline powered fan | 2 | \$ 3,300.00 | \$6,600.00 | \$ 2,356.00 | \$4,712.00 | \$ 2,485.00 | \$4,970.00 |
| B.1 | IV | Structural radiant heat protection coats, with below and radio pockets with microphone tabs - sizes to be provided to awarded vendor | 6 | \$ 1,325.00 | \$7,950.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 1,082.50 | \$6,495.00 |
| B.2 | IV | Structural radiant heat protection trousers with pockets and exchangeable knee re-enforcements - sizes to be provided to awarded vendor (price per pair) | 6 | \$ 875.00 | \$5,250.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 758.80 | \$4,552.80 |
| B.3 | IV | ARFF Structural proximity gloves which provides reflective/radiant heat protection with leather palms - sizes to be provided to awarded vendor (price per pair) | 6 | \$ 285.00 | \$1,710.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 174.00 | \$1,044.00 |
| B.4 | IV | ARFF boots, rubber, with pull on loops, toe and cushioned shin guard - sizes to be provided to awarded vendor (price per pair) | 6 | \$ 290.00 | \$1,740.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| B.5 | IV | Complete SCBA including one (1) 30 minute bottle, one (1) face piece and PASS device. Must meet current NFPA 1981 Standard and match customer's standard fittings | 6 | \$ 7,612.00 | \$45,672.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 7,950.00 | \$47,700.00 |
| B.6 | IV | Nomex hoods | 6 | \$ 40.00 | \$240.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 24.95 | \$149.70 |
| B.7 | IV | Structural style helmets with shrouds and gold coated face shields | 6 | \$ 700.00 | \$4,200.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Total Award | | | | \$71,292.00 | | \$16,684.00 | | \$63,615.48 | |