



Rhode Island Airport Corporation

IFB 29844 - Janitorial Products
 Bid Abstract
 October 11, 2019 at 10:00AM

Bidder Name:	Estimated Annual Usage (Case)	Unipak Corp.	Interboro Packaging (A)	Interboro Packaging (B)	Interboro Packaging (C)	Interboro Packaging (D)	Interboro Packaging (E)	W. B. Mason Co., Inc.	Staples Contract & Commercial LLC	Milhench Supply Co., Inc.	American Veteran Enterprise Team LLC	Eastern Bag & Paper Company / EBP Supply Solutions Inc.	Supreme Industrial Products, Inc.	Banner Systems Inc.	Central Poly-Bag Corp.	Mansfield Paper Company, Inc.	Fordion Packaging Ltd	Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC (1)	Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC (2)	Hillyard, Inc.	Casey Engineered Maintenance, Inc.	S Star Enterprise, Inc.
Trash Bags 1 38" x 60", 22 mic, Natural/Clear color, 200 bags per case Central Poly CP3860N22	800	\$ 21.50	\$ 25.98	\$ 23.94	\$ 20.84	\$ 17.72	\$ 15.48	Yr 1 \$ 20.26 Yr 2 \$ 20.68 Yr 3 \$ 21.13	\$ 39.83	\$ 22.89	Yr 1 \$ 24.70 Yr 2 \$ 26.00 Yr 3 \$ 27.37	Yr 1 \$ 31.23 Yr 2 \$ 34.35 Yr 3 \$ 37.77	\$ 22.75	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.90	\$ 24.36	\$ 19.56	Yr 1 \$ 20.05 Yr 2 \$ 20.77 Yr 3 \$ 21.51	Yr 1 \$ 20.60 Yr 2 \$ 21.34 Yr 3 \$ 21.95	\$ 24.25	\$ 29.86	No Bid
Trash Bags 2 24" x 36", 10 mic, Natural/Clear color, 1000 bags per case Central Poly CP2436N10	50	\$ 19.90	\$ 27.24	\$ 20.84	\$ 17.48	\$ 17.48	\$ 17.48	Yr 1 \$ 19.66 Yr 2 \$ 20.07 Yr 3 \$ 20.51	\$ 29.94	\$ 20.92	Yr 1 \$ 22.60 Yr 2 \$ 23.79 Yr 3 \$ 25.04	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.66	\$ 22.40	No Bid	\$ 20.75	Yr 1 \$ 16.12 Yr 2 \$ 16.75 Yr 3 \$ 17.15	No Bid	\$ 21.96	\$ 26.71	No Bid
Toilet Seat Covers 3 Half fold, 20 packs, 250 per pack, 5000 per case Tradex TSCR5000	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 25.77 Yr 2 \$ 26.32 Yr 3 \$ 26.88	\$ 35.04	\$ 28.66	Yr 1 \$ 32.54 Yr 2 \$ 34.25 Yr 3 \$ 36.05	\$ 27.38	\$ 27.00	\$ 31.75	No Bid	\$ 42.67	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 22.70 Yr 2 \$ 23.45 Yr 3 \$ 24.15	No Bid	\$ 36.08	\$ 40.83	\$ 33.71
Liquid Hand Soap 4 Coconut Oil base, four (4) - 1 gallon bottles per case Simonize CS0280004	300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 19.96 Yr 2 \$ 19.36 Yr 3 \$ 19.77	\$ 21.15	\$ 17.49	Yr 1 \$ 36.20 Yr 2 \$ 38.11 Yr 3 \$ 40.12	No Bid	\$ 15.65	\$ 16.42	No Bid	\$ 16.68	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 17.01 Yr 2 \$ 17.55 Yr 3 \$ 18.05	No Bid	\$ 28.56	\$ 29.93	\$ 50.41
Bath Tissue 5 1-Ply, 1210 sheets per roll 4" x 4.05" 10,890 sq ft, 80 rolls per case Georgia Pacific 14580	1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 41.08 Yr 2 \$ 41.95 Yr 3 \$ 43.85	\$ 48.35	\$ 51.92	Yr 1 \$ 52.11 Yr 2 \$ 54.85 Yr 3 \$ 57.74	Yr 1 \$ 45.05 Yr 2 \$ 47.74 Yr 3 \$ 49.60	\$ 42.84	\$ 42.16	No Bid	\$ 40.62	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 39.75 Yr 2 \$ 40.99 Yr 3 \$ 42.25	No Bid	\$ 46.89	\$ 45.76	\$ 65.86
Hand Towels 6 8" diameter, TAD white roll towel, 8" diameter, 1000', 6 rolls per case Georgia Pacific 26100	1500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 31.70 Yr 2 \$ 32.37 Yr 3 \$ 33.06	\$ 36.20	\$ 36.53	Yr 1 \$ 30.04 Yr 2 \$ 31.62 Yr 3 \$ 33.28	Yr 1 \$ 35.53 Yr 2 \$ 36.55 Yr 3 \$ 38.32	\$ 33.75	\$ 30.30	No Bid	\$ 32.46	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 41.00 Yr 2 \$ 42.30 Yr 3 \$ 43.60	No Bid	\$ 36.18	\$ 49.72	\$ 70.59
Wax Bag Liners 7 Kraft paper 7 1/2" x 10 1/4" x 3 1/2", 500 per case Hospital Specialty KL/260	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 15.26 Yr 2 \$ 15.58 Yr 3 \$ 15.91	\$ 15.88	\$ 15.79	Yr 1 \$ 18.29 Yr 2 \$ 19.25 Yr 3 \$ 20.26	No Bid	\$ 15.22	\$ 16.47	No Bid	\$ 20.69	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 12.80 Yr 2 \$ 13.20 Yr 3 \$ 13.60	No Bid	\$ 14.63	\$ 23.63	\$ 25.39
Baby Changing Station 8 Moisture proof back, 500 per case Banner 67015	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 32.06 Yr 2 \$ 32.74 Yr 3 \$ 33.44	\$ 40.00	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 114.47 Yr 2 \$ 120.50 Yr 3 \$ 126.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.37	No Bid	\$ 56.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 118.34	\$ 41.08	\$ 49.39
Hand Sanitizer 9 GOJO Purell #2256-04 NXT Instant Refill, 4 per case	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 62.63 Yr 2 \$ 63.95 Yr 3 \$ 65.32	\$ 108.90	\$ 32.67	Yr 1 \$ 89.24 Yr 2 \$ 93.94 Yr 3 \$ 98.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.00	No Bid	\$ 85.62	No Bid	Yr 1 \$ 85.90 Yr 2 \$ 88.50 Yr 3 \$ 91.30	No Bid	\$ 87.28	\$ 27.50	\$ 91.59

Awarded
 Lowest Bidder/Product did not meet specification